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A Transformative Journey of Faith 

Andre Chang  
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ 
This past summer, I embarked on a transformative journey at St. Bridget 
Chinese Catholic Church's youth camp, where I discovered a deeper 
connection with God. Growing up, my relationship with faith had always 
been somewhat distant, but this camp changed everything. Surrounded 
by peers who shared a common goal of spiritual growth, I found myself in 
an environment ripe for introspection and divine encounter.  

The camp's schedule was filled with various activities designed to nurture 
our faith. Among these, the Taizé prayer sessions were particularly 
impactful. Taizé, known for its meditative chants and periods of silence, 
provided a serene space for contemplation. Each evening, we gathered 
in the chapel, illuminated by soft candlelight, and engaged in this peaceful 
form of worship. The repetitive chants, sung in multiple languages, 
created a sense of unity and calm that I had never experienced before.  

During these Taizé sessions, I felt an unprecedented sense of peace 
wash over me. The simplicity of the chants allowed me to focus on the 
presence of God rather than the complexity of words. One chant, in 
particular, "Ubi Caritas," resonated deeply within me. As we sang "Where 
charity and love are, God is there," I began to understand God's love in a 
new light � as an omnipresent force, accessible to all who seek it with an 
open heart.  

Another pivotal element of the camp was the discussion sessions focused 
on God and family. We gathered in small groups to share our personal 
experiences and thoughts on how faith shapes our relationships. These 
discussions were eye-opening and heartwarming, as they highlighted the 
integral role of family in our spiritual journeys. I realized that God's love is 
often reflected in the love and support we receive from our families. 

A particularly powerful session was dedicated to the theme of healing. We 
explored how faith can be a source of comfort and strength during difficult 
times. Listening to my peers share their stories of healing � whether from 
physical ailments, emotional wounds, or spiritual struggles � was 
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incredibly moving. These testimonies reinforced my belief in God's 
capacity to heal and restore, providing hope and encouragement for my 
own challenges.  

The camp also included a variety of outdoor activities that brought us 
closer to God through nature. We hiked, played sports, and participated 
in team-building exercises that fostered a sense of fellowship and unity. 
Being in the great outdoors, surrounded by the beauty of God's creation, 
was a reminder of His omnipresence and the wonders of His works. 
These activities not only strengthened our bonds as a group but also 
deepened our appreciation for the natural world.  

One afternoon, we had a session dedicated to personal testimonies. 
Listening to my peers share their struggles and triumphs in faith was 
incredibly moving. Their stories of overcoming doubt, finding purpose, 
and experiencing divine interventions reinforced my belief in God's 
presence in our lives. I realized that faith is a journey, and we all have our 
unique paths shaped by our experiences and encounters with the divine.  

The camp also offered opportunities for service, which deepened my 
understanding of God's calling to love and serve others. We visited a local 
shelter, where we spent time with the residents, listening to their stories 
and offering support. This act of service not only brought joy to those we 
helped but also filled me with a sense of fulfillment and purpose. It was a 
tangible reminder of Jesus' teaching to love our neighbors as ourselves.  

As the camp drew to the end, I reflected on the profound experiences and 
lessons I had gained. The combination of Taizé prayer, discussion 
sessions, healing conversations, outdoor activities, and acts of service 
had brought me closer to God in ways I had never imagined. I left St. 
Bridget Chinese Catholic Church with a renewed sense of faith, eager to 
continue nurturing my relationship with God in my everyday life.  

Upon returning home, I made a conscious effort to incorporate the 
practices I had learned at camp into my daily routine. I set aside time for 
prayer and meditation, participated more actively in my church 
community, and sought opportunities to serve others. This summer youth 
camp was more than just an event; it was the beginning of a lifelong 
journey of faith, igniting a profound and lasting connection with God. 


